
Hello all! I hope everyone is enjoying this
beautiful summer weather and the fellowship
of The Club. This is the time we have all
been waiting for and I’m delighted to say
folks are coming out and enjoying the great
food, attentive service and good friends! If
you remember, please try to make reserva-
tions for dining. It may seem like not a big
deal, but it helps the staff SO much to have
an idea of how many folks are coming out
for both the servers and the kitchen. Please
understand..busy is great, but we want to be
fabulous at busy and a heads up to the staff
helps everything run smoothly. Put BLYC’s
number in your phone, 740.929.9941 and
give a jingle, it really helps.

We are keeping the pool bar open later on
the weekends and Governor Sproat has a
fabulous line up of entertainment to keep
things sizzling lake side! Our financial num-
bers are looking better for bar and kitchen
than we have seen in years. A HUGE thanks
to Andrea and Chef Matt and the rest of the

staff for their dedication and efforts to keep
costs low and quality high! Please give The
Club a call if the weather seems dicey if you
are planning on using the pool bar. 

In our continued effort to keep costs low,
if the weather is poor or there are few in
attendance, we may stop staffing the pool bar
for the day. Of course, the upstairs would
still be open and you could still come into
the pool, but staffing is one of our biggest
expenses and keeping a tight rein helps our
numbers a lot. See you at The Club!

The 4th is upon us and we are all hoping
for a great time as usual. The fireworks are
always amazing and I can’t wait to see what
we get this year.

Our first poolside entertainment was June
10. Chris Gill played and sang for the crowd
and there was a great crowd. I can’t wait to
hear Billy Reiter, our next performer.

It is so good to see the club full of people,
both inside and out. The docks are filling up
rapidly so contact Chuck Wadley to see if
there is something left.

There are so many things planned for the
4th of July I can’t begin to list all of them.
Check the website for all the details. The
Commodore’s Steak fry is July 7th and
despite the fact that I will be cooking I hope
to see you there. Matt has promised to help
me so I’m sure it will be perfect.

Don’t forget to come out to the parties and
entertainment or just for dinner and the best
view in the state. Let’s make this an unfor-
gettable summer!
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AHOY! The sailing season off to a terrific
start.  At the time of printing we have com-
pleted 4 races In the Lambrecht Cup series
and 1 Long Distance race.  We also have 5
boats in the cruiser class; Bendig, Harris,
Cartwright, Reynolds & Snow, and 4 boats
in the one design class; Goodyear, Colin
Gutridge, Michael Davis, and Van Gilder.
For detailed race results please go to the
website for times.  A short summary is:

Memorial Day Long Distance race: 1st-
Snow, 2nd-Reynolds, 3rd-Van Gilder, 4th-
Harris, 5th-Cartwright

Lambrect Cup Racing: (Note: 1st group list-
ed = Cruisers, 2nd listed = One Designs)

5/27/12: Race #1: 1st - Cartwright, 2nd -
Harris,  - Snow (RAF); Race #2: 1st - Snow,
2nd - Cartwright, 3rd - Harris; Race #3: 1st -
Snow, 2nd - Cartwright,  - Harris (DNS)

6/3/12: Race #1: 1st - Snow, 2nd - Reynolds,
3rd - Bendig; Race #2: 1st - Reynolds, 2nd -
Snow, 3rd - Bendig; Race #3:  1st - Reynolds,
2nd - Bendig,  3rd - Harris

6/10/12: Race #1: 1st - Bendig, 2nd-- Snow,
3rd - Harris; 1st - Goodyear, 2nd - M. Davis,
3rd - Gutridge; Race #2: 1st - Snow, 2nd--
Bendig,  3rd - Harris; 1st - Goodyear, 2nd - M.
Davis, 3rd - Gutridge; Race #3:  1st - Snow,
2nd - Harris,  3rd - Bendig; Goodyear  (Davis
& Gutridge DNS)

6/17/12: Race #1: 1st - Reynolds, 2nd--
Snow, 3rd - Cartwright; 1st -VanGilder, 2nd -

Goodyear; Race #2: 1st - Reynolds, 2nd--
Carwright, 3rd - Harris; 1st -VanGilder, 2nd -
Goodyear; Race #3:  1st - Reynolds, 2nd--
Cartwright, 3rd - Snow; 1st -VanGilder, 2nd -
Goodyear

I want to send a special thanks out to my
Racing Team: Don Day, Tom Baltzell, Steve
Harris, Karen Baltzell (photography), and
Dave Lawrence.  Thanks guys (and gals),
without you this would not be possible.  And
another special thanks to our sailors, without
you guys braving the elements, there'd be
nothing to do on Sunday!

Sailing Net: If you want to know every-
thing about the wind you should download
and app called MarineCast powered by
Sailflow.  Once downloaded, go to "settings"
and change the "region" to Ohio, and the
"site" to Newark.  This site shows observed
wind speed and direction, and projects wind

speed and direction for the next 24 hours.
Don't forget the Long Distance race on the

4th of July.  We have had tremendous wind
and exciting competition.  We hope to see
more spectators on the front porch during
racing events.  Don't forget, if you are rac-
ing, or watching, you get $1 beers on the
front porch.  So come on down and get
blown away by the racing action and quench
your thirst at the same time.  Argggggh!

Governor
Dave

Luttenberger

Race &
Regatta

Here it is! The best weather and parties of
the year. On July 3 do not miss the fire-
works. We have Dan and Randy entertaining
before and after the fireworks. Reservations
are a must.

On July 4th the flag raising is at 10am,
followed by the singing of our National
Anthem by Marcia Henderson. Howard
Everitt will next play Taps in honor of our
men and women in uniform. Family Day
follows.

The Commodores' Steak Fry is July 7.
The entertainment is Wendy Pennington and
her great rock and roll band. The great gui-
tarist Lou Cass returns with his two backup
singers on July 8 for a poolside show. This
will be fun in the sun.

On July 14 we welcome back the incom-
parable Arnett Howard and Friends. Again
reservations a must. Dirty Money, a super
group from Columbus, will feature live band
karaoke on July 21. This is your chance to
sing with a band! Do not miss it!

Dave and Miranda entertain at poolside
on July 22.

We welcome the return of Chris Gill on
Friday , July 27 for a special evening pool
party by popular demand. He will be play-
ing from 7-10 pm.

Mark your calenders for the Luau with the
Majestics  August 4, the return of Soul
Annex  August 10,  50s/60s Night with Dj
John August 17,  the Classic Boat Regatta
with Don Beck August 18, the Millersport
Community Theater with Broadway show
tunes on August 24 and the BLYC Car
Show August 26.

See you at the Club.
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Membership

Rear
Commodore

Tim Ryan

Governor
John Sproat

Entertainment

Everything is heating up, don’t miss out.
Get to the Club and enjoy the food, the fun
and the lake.

Please introduce yourself to all of the
New Members.

Also help us out and your Club please get
your dues in to the Club as soon as possible.
If you don’t, just think of all the fun you will
miss out on.

It is with sadness and regret that we
inform you of the loss of PC Fred Wright,
on June 15. Our condolences are extended
to his wife Ruth, daughter Sheri and son
Kevin.

Fred served in the Infantry in Europe in
WWII and resided at Harbor Hills .

He will be remembered for his many con-
tributions to our club , community and
country.



Our new Area 300 docks are rented. There
are several slips available at East Port and
slips for smaller boats available in the west-
ern basin.

In addition to docks, there are storage
spaces and garages available to rent.

If you wish to rent a dock, garage, or boat-
yard storage, please complete a "Rental
Request Form".  The form is available on
the Yacht Club website under Docks &
Facilities. The form may be submitted
online, printed, or is available at the club
office.  

Please submit this form if you wish to
cancel or change your assigned space or add
a boat hoist.  All changes require prior
approval.

Members using the boat yard and docks,
please remember to secure the gates as you
enter or exit. This will help to ensure that
both you and your neighbors' property are
protected.

Please contact me with any questions or
concerns regarding docks, and Governor
Lyons concerning the rental houses.

An early reminder, the Classic Boat
Regatta is August 17-19, 2012. 

We are requesting that all Watkins Island
dock holders make their slips available dur-
ing this event. The event is open to the pub-
lic on Saturday, August 18, from 10am to
6pm.

COME AND ENJOY YOUR CLUB!
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Back in the 1970’s, the Past Commodores
of BLYC decided they wanted to do some-
thing nice for the membership. Thus was
born the Commodores Steak Fry. 

Each year, this fun, perhaps quirky group,
comes together for a very enjoyable evening
at which THEY do the cooking. (Don’t
worry Chef Matt keeps a close eye on quali-
ty control). Come join us for good, afford-
able food and entertainment – both the band
AND the Past Commodores – Saturday, July
7.  The Commodores would love to serve
you!

* * * * *
I don't want to be a party p**per.....but

also and more important we don't want to
jeopardize our liquor license.

RULE 25 of The BLYC Bar Rules clearly
states , " Do Not take sealed or open con-
tainers of alcoholic beverages off the PER-
MIT PREMISES " ,folks this means off
island ,including on to a boat.

This includes guests , attendees of private
parties as well as members. We MUST com-
ply , do your part to keep us happily in com-
pliance, make on the spot corrections ,when
you see an infraction.

We will all appreciate you for it.

Governor
Jerry

Besanceney

Publications

Docks &
Rentals

Governor
Charles Wadley

KEEP UP TO DATE ON
EVERYTHING BLYC

www.buckeyelakeyc.com

This is an exciting year for me; watching
the Jr's work and grow is such an exciting
opportunity. We have over 50 juniors sched-
uled and/or completed sailing camp this
year; with more scheduling every day for the
final week of camp (July 9-12). I also want
to thank Tracey Davis and my wife Karen
for all of their help with the many Jr. Sailing
activities.

Past Jr. Racers
Earlier this year I attended collegiate races

at Hoover Sailing Club. BLYC was well rep-
resented:

Halle Harklau, Austin Miller, Evan Miller,
Mallory Miller, Gwen Mulvey, and Libbi
Dust (Michigan State University, past
instructor and coach at BLYC). These sailors
represented The Ohio State University, Ohio
University, and Wittenberg. Gwen is the new
Commodore of The Ohio State University
sailing team; Congratulations Gwen!

Jr Racers
The first event was held at Hoover Sailing

Club, June 9. BLYC had 5 participants:
• Colin Gutridge - Full Rig Laser
• Michael Davis - Laser
• Jaylyn and James Jarman and Savannah

West - 420
First Week of Camp a Success!!!
Yes...we have a new instructor, "Nici"

Bregel. She's from the Hoover Sailing Club;
comes from a family of sailors. Her father,
John Bregel, is helping to coach the BLYC
Jr. Racers.

Nici, with the help of Colin Gutridge and
Michael Davis, instructed this year's first

week of sailing camps. We had a great week.
Weather was great; lots of excitement.

Jr Sailing Save the Dates
• June 23 - I-LYA Jr. Sailing Travelers

Series Regatta at BLYC - yup...it's upon us.
We should have about 50 sailors: two classes
of Opti's, two classes of Lasers, and one
class of 420's. Racing is from about 11 am
on Saturday, June 23, until around 3 or so.
Come on out and support the BLYC Juniors!

•Additional camps will be held the weeks
of June 25-29 and July 9-12 (4 day week)

•Tuesday, Evening July 3rd Fireworks on
Buckeye Lake - Jr Sailing kicking off 2nd
Raffle Fundraiser to be drawn at noon on
July 4th 

• Wednesday Morning July 4th - THE
PANCAKE FLIPPERS (aka the BLYC Jr
Sailing kids) will be flipping your pancakes
as they sing that morning. You don't want to
miss what they have in store.

• Sunday September 2nd  Jr Sailing
Spaghetti Dinner - Food, entertainment &
silent auction 

Governor
Michael McVey

Junior Sailing

DONNA PARKER:

A special THANKS from your BLYC
friends.

Flowers everywhere and beautifully done
thanks to your near daily volunteer work to
plant and care for them.

One person can make a difference. When
you see Donna don't forget to say ... Thanks
for the flowers!



Greetings from TEAM BLYC!
Summer is well on its way!  The team

members have been working very hard to
make your time here at your club pleasura-
ble.  Because of the mass attendance by our
members, I can only hope that it is because
you are all having a great time here with fab-
ulous food, delicious drinks and fun family
time. Therefore, you keep coming back for
MORE!

There have been a few concerns with
linen tablecloths on the porch tables.  I
believe I have found a solution.  We will
leave the tables as is during lunch service
and cloth them for dinner service.

I would like to give a “Shout Out” to all
those members who are making dining
reservations ahead of time during normal
open dining including Sunday breakfast.
Thank you so much from all of us at TEAM
BLYC.  It allows us to provide the service
you deserve.  If you don’t make reserva-
tions, you are always WELCOME at your

club.  However, if we are busy, we won’t be
able to seat you right away.  Have no fear
we have a gorgeous bar and wonderful bar-
tenders who would love to serve you a liba-
tion while you wait. 

If I can ask everyone to please make sure
that you check in with the host/hostess or
bartender upon arrival; that will ensure that
we know you are here.  If you seat yourself,
there is a chance that you might get over
looked and we don’t want that.  TEAM
BLYC thanks you in advance. 

Here is the lineup for the days leading up
to July 4th.

Saturday, June 30 - Normal open dining

Sunday, July 1 - Breakfast buffet 9am-
noon (NO normal breakfast);  Limited
Lunch/Dinner menu noon-8pm;  Pool Bar
open (weather permitting)11:30-5

Monday, July 2 - Club Closed; Pool bar
open(weather permitting)11:30-5

Tuesday, July 3 - Fireworks at dusk 
(Dan and Randy entertainment)
RESERVATIONS ARE A MUST!! we

will do our best to accommodate the seating
requests, but there are no guarantees. Pool
bar open (weather permitting) 11:30-5. Club
will be open from 11-4pm with a limited
menu (see page 7). Porch picnic under food
tent from 5-dusk. (There will be no open
dining or pool food served after 5pm, just
the picnic). Menu on page 7.

Wednesday, July 4 - Jr. Sail pancake
breakfast 9-11am.Limited menu from 11-
8pm.Pool bar open (weather permitting)
11:30-5. Dance with DJ for BLYC children
7-10pm.

Come out and enjoy your Club!

Andrea Foster

From The
Manager
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BLYC's first Classic Boat Regatta …
In the late 1970s and early ‘80s, sailboat

racing was king at BLYC.  If one peruses the
old issues of the Log available on the BLYC
website (Thank you P/C Frank Foster, III for
making these available), it's easy to see that
most of the Club activity at that time cen-
tered around sailboat racing and social
events.  There just doesn't seem that there
was that much geared toward our power-
boating and non-racing members. In 1981,
BLYC's 75th Anniversary year, that
changed.

It was first announced in the December,
1980 Log by Race & Regatta Governor
Gordon Forster that a new weekend activity
was being developed ... "An invitational
classic and antique WOODEN power and
sailboat regatta."  The first chairman was
P/C Ed Metzgar.  The entry fee was $20 per
boat and 28 boats participated.  According to
the post-event write-up in the Log ...

Commodore Jim Dressel, committee
members and entrants were more than
pleased after launching the first, of what's
hoped to be many, antique boat contest.

The weatherman cooperated by bathing
the north shore area with plenty of sun, per-
fect to bring out the patina of lovingly cared-
for mahogany, gleaming chrome and mellow
brass.  Last minute scurrying before judging
found them polishing hulls and wiping tell-
tale finger and foot marks from chrome

hardware and touch-me-not-decks.
In the past 30+ years, the show has cer-

tainly evolved.  The name has changed, it
now includes classic non-wooden boats, and
each year may bring different types of boats
and participants from different parts of the
country.  But, it doesn't sound like that much
has changed.  Every year since 1981, BLYC
has hosted this highlight event of our sum-
mer season and, just as in that first show,
nervous boat owners clean & polish and pre-
pare their pride-and-joy crafts for judging
and the admiration of spectators.

At the 1981 event, the "Best of Show"
Trophy went to Mrs. Zenna Sayre for her
1928, 26' triple cockpit Chris Craft
Runabout, Cherokee.  The First Place trophy
for "Nearest to Original Condition" went to
Phil Schell for a 1948 Chris Craft Sedan,
Margus.  If I'm not mistaken, both of these
families have had boats in every Classic
Boat Regatta BLYC has hosted.  And…
1981 wasn't the only time they've taken

home well-deserved trophies.
Other BLYC members earning trophies in

1981 included Mrs. Nancy Benson, 1st Place
"Oldest Restored," for her 1928 Chris Craft
Runabout and P/C Gus Schell, "Sailboat
Special Award," for his 1931 Ludke "K"
Boat, Cat's Paw.  I'm pretty sure that both
boats are still around Buckeye Lake,
although I know that the years have taken
their toll on Cat's Paw.  She is one of the last
"K" boats remaining of what was once one
of the premier sailing fleets in this region.

This year's Classic Boat Regatta, under
the Chairmanship of Governor Chuck
Wadley, will be held the weekend of August
17-19.  Just as in 1981, it will certainly be a
highlight of our summer season.  Not only is
this a great event for our members, it is also
a time when we have the opportunity to
show off our great Club to the public at
large.  Make plans now to attend, participate
in, or volunteer for this great BLYC tradi-
tion!

For more information on this year's
Classic Boat Regatta, please visit the BLYC
website at www.buckeyelakeyc.com or con-
tact Governor Chuck Wadley at
crwadley@hotmail.com

P/C Steve
Harris, Club

Historian

Looking Aft
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July 3

July 4

July 5-6
July 7

• July 3rd Picnic served 5-10 pm
(reservations required)

• “Dan and Randy” from Papa Boo’s - 
7:30-9:30 pm

• Fireworks at dusk

• Junior Sailing Pancake Breakfast, 9 - 12
• Carnival Themed Family Fun Day.

Cookout, Noon-8 pm

• Dining, 11:30 - 10
(open dining)

• Commodores Steak Fry
• See menu and pricing on previous page
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A BIG Thank You to Gail
Klink for hosting our June
meeting. So many members
came with their family and
friends to share a wonderful
evening. If you missed it, you
missed out but there is still
time to join the Auxiliary for
more great summer events.

Come and celebrate July 4th
at the club “carnival style”
with games and food for all
the family.The always popular
Cranberry Bog Tour is sched-
uled for July 12th. Space will
fill up fast so make your reser-
vations soon. Mark your
diaries for August 9th Game
Day and the Auxiliary
Fundraiser September 8th.
Reservations for all events can
be made by calling the club at
(740) 929-4466.

Your Auxiliary Committee

Auxiliary

CHICKEN TENDERS
$5.99

ROASTED GARLIC HUMMUS
$4.99

MOZARELLA STICKS W/ MARINARA
$5.99

QUESADILLA
$5.99

55 NORTH BANK SALAD
½ $3.99                    Full $7.99

Add Chicken $3.99

HOT DOG WITH CHIPS
$3.00

(additional hot dog $1.50)

BRATWURST WITH CHIPS
$4.50

BYO CHICKEN OR BURGER WITH CHIPS
$5.99

($.55 for additional toppings)
American, Swiss, Cheddar, Pepper Jack, Blue Cheese

Sautéed Onions, Sautéed Mushrooms, Bacon

ADD FRIES $2.00

JULY 3rd
Limited Menu

Served 11 am - 4 pm

Appetizers
Coconut Seamed Mussels
Coconut Lime Broth, Crostini

$7.99

Creole BBQ Shrimp
Served over Grits

$7.99

Carribean Fried Chicken Strips
Tossed with Citrus Glaze

$5.99

Arnett Howard and the Creole Funk Band
Summer Funk Jam

Saturday, July 14th

THIS IS A VERY POPULAR EVENT. RESERVATIONS PLEASE.  929-4466

Entrees
Slow Roasted Pork Loin

Finished with Orange Glaze
Served over Black Beans and Rice

$13.99

Pineapple Shrimp
Sautéed Shrimp, Pineapple, Peppers,

Finished in a Rum Glaze 
Served over rice

$14.99

Carribean Spiced Pan Seared Grouper
Mango Chili Emulsion

Served over Black Beans and Rice
$17.99

Chicken and Andouille Sausage Jambalaya
Classic Louisiana Stew Served with Rice

$11.99
add Shrimp $6.99

Grilled Creole Sirloin
Topped with Crumbled Blue Cheese

Scallion Mashed Potatoes, Asparagus
$16.99
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A Fine Day For A Sail ... And A Race

all photos courtesy of Karen Baltzell
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Buckeye Lake
Yacht Club

FROM THE BRIDGE 

July
3 Porch Picnic, Fireworks

4 Jr Sailing Pancake Breakfast
Family Fun Day, Cookout

7 Commodores’ Steak Fry

12 Board Meeting,
Auxiliary Bog Tour

14 Arnett Howard & Band

21 Karaoke with Dirty Money

22 Pool Party - Dave & Miranda

27 Chris Gill - Poolside

The 2011-2012 Board
Commodore Bob Zeiher

Vice Commodore
Gayle Fisher-Mulvey 

Bar & Kitchen
Rear Commodore Tim Ryan 

Membership
Governor John Sproat

Entertainment
Governor Jeff Lyons

House & Grounds
Gerry Besanceney

Log & Publications
Chuck Wadley

Docks & Rentals
Michael McVey

Junior Sailing
Dave Luttenberger

Race & Regatta

The Trustees
Commodore Ray Kent

Commodore Joe Campbell
Commodore Mike Jacobs
Commodore Don Harris

Commodore Rick Henderson

2012 Standing Committees
Commodore’s Association .................. Commodore Ray Kentl

I-LYADelegate ...................................... Commodore Gus Schell

Alternate Commodore ..................... Commodore Steve Harris

Blue Gavel Commodore ................. Commodore Steve Harris

Fleet Captain ......................................... Commodore Don Harris

Power Fleet Captain ...................... Commodore Joe Campbell

Fleet Surgeon ............................................... Dr. John VanGilder

Fleet Chaplain .................................................... Fr. Mike Gribble

Parliamentarian ........................... Commodore Frank Foster III
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